

**P#2018-24 - SMOOTH INTERIOR PLASTIC  
AWARD - FEBRUARY 8, 2018**

**\*\*\*AWARD AL**

|             | ETNA SUPPLY COMPANY |                 |             | ADS                |                 |             |
|-------------|---------------------|-----------------|-------------|--------------------|-----------------|-------------|
|             | S.I.P.              | SLIP JOINT      | BANDS       | S.I.P.             | SLIP JOINT      | BANDS       |
|             | <i>per foot</i>     | <i>per foot</i> | <i>each</i> | <i>per foot</i>    | <i>per foot</i> | <i>each</i> |
| 12"x24'     | \$4.35              | \$4.35          | \$6.26      | \$4.35             | \$4.35          | \$6.26      |
| 15"x20'     | \$5.85              | \$5.85          | \$10.43     | \$5.85             | \$5.85          | \$10.43     |
| 18"x20'     | \$8.35              | \$8.35          | \$17.77     | \$8.35             | \$8.35          | \$17.77     |
| 24"x20'     | \$13.50             | \$13.50         | \$25.06     | \$13.50            | \$13.50         | \$25.06     |
| 36"x20'     | \$25.17             | \$25.17         | \$81.06     | \$25.17            | \$25.17         | \$81.06     |
| 48"x20'     | no bid              | no bid          | \$139.28    | no bid             | no bid          | no bid      |
| 60"x20"     | no bid              | no bid          | no bid      | no bid             | no bid          | no bid      |
| 72"x20'     | no bid              | no bid          | no bid      | no bid             | no bid          | no bid      |
| Lubricant   | per gallon          | \$21.00         |             | per gallon         | n/a             |             |
| Perf. Drain | 4"x100'             | \$0.57          | per ft.     | 4"x100'            | \$0.57          | per ft.     |
| with fabric | 6"x100"             | \$1.05          | per ft.     | 6"x100'            | \$1.05          | per ft.     |
| DELIVERY    | stock - 1 week      |                 |             | min. order \$5,000 |                 |             |
|             | CORE & MAIN         |                 |             |                    |                 |             |
|             | S.I.P.              | SLIP JOINT      | BANDS       | CMP                | SLIP JOINT      | BANDS       |
|             | <i>per foot</i>     | <i>per foot</i> | <i>each</i> |                    |                 |             |
| 12"x24'     | \$4.350             | \$4.350         | \$6.26      |                    |                 |             |
| 15"x20'     | \$5.850             | \$5.850         | \$10.43     |                    |                 |             |
| 18"x20'     | \$8.350             | \$8.350         | \$17.77     |                    |                 |             |
| 24"x20'     | \$13.500            | \$13.50         | \$25.060    |                    |                 |             |
| 36"x20'     | \$25.17             | \$25.17         | \$81.06     |                    |                 |             |
| 48"x20'     | \$56.85             | no bid          | \$139.28    |                    |                 |             |
| 60"x20"     | \$85.56             | no bid          | \$282.13    |                    |                 |             |
| 30"x20'     | no bid              | no bid          | no bid      |                    |                 |             |
| Lubricant   | per gallon          | \$0.00          | with pipe   |                    |                 |             |
| Perf. Drain |                     | \$0.570         | per ft.     |                    |                 |             |
| with fabric |                     | \$1.050         | per ft.     |                    |                 |             |
| DELIVERY    | 5 business days     |                 |             |                    |                 |             |

