

**P#2018-14 GRADER BLADES
AWARD - FEBRUARY 8, 2018**

***AWARD ALL BIDDERS BASED ON PRICE AND AVAILA

	WINTER EQUIP. CO.		ST. REGIS		TRUCK & TRAILER	
	\$Price ea	Total	\$Price ea	Total	\$Price ea	Total
3/4"x8"x6' Curved Single Bevel Qty. 600	\$62.22	\$37,332.00	\$85.68	\$51,408.00	\$75.53	\$45,318.00
Rockwell Hardness Qty. 200	\$76.51	\$15,302.00	\$88.50	\$17,700.00	\$90.62	\$18,124.00
3/4" x 8" x 7' Curved Single Bevel Qty. 200	\$89.27	\$17,854.00	\$99.96	\$19,992.00	\$111.49	\$22,298.00
3/4" x 8" x 6' Curved Single Bevel Ice Blades Qty. 100	\$88.57	\$8,857.00	\$112.80	\$11,280.00	\$130.27	\$13,027.00
3/4" x 8" x 7' Curved Single Bevel Ice Blades Qty. 30	\$103.33	\$3,099.90	\$131.60	\$3,948.00	\$145.71	\$4,371.30
5/8" x 8" x 11' Flat Side Plow Blades Qty. 50	\$80.97	\$4,048.50	\$142.40	\$7,120.00	\$71.08	\$3,554.00
5/8" x 8" x 108" Wing Blades Qty. 50	\$85.32	\$4,266.00	\$127.50	\$6,375.00	\$114.06	\$5,703.00
5/8" x 7/8" x 8" x 6' XTRA EDGE Blade Qty. 50	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$88.60 \$112.13	\$4,430.00 \$5,606.50
1/8"x8"x12' Flat Side Plow Blades Qty. 20	\$110.94	\$2,218.80	\$161.85	\$6,375.00	\$123.99	\$2,479.80
1/8"x8"x144" Flat Side Plow Blades Qty. 20						
TOTAL		\$92,978.20		\$121,060.00		\$124,911.60
MT 10105 Carbide Tools	\$6.04			no bid		
MT 10106 Carbide Tools						
MT 10107 Carbide Tools						
(delivered in lots of 260 or more)						
DELIVERY	4-5 weeks ARO		4-6 weeks ARO		3-5 weeks ARO	
Prices Good For			60 days			

NOTES :

*quoting double bevel
standard dbl bevel curved 5/8"x8"x
*thru-hardened not surface hardened

BILITY***

MICHIGAN CAT		LK MANUFACTUR	
\$Price ea	Total	\$Price ea	Total
\$94.29	\$56,574.00	no bid	
\$94.29	\$18,858.00	no bid	
\$108.80	\$21,760.00	no bid	
\$110.83	\$11,083.00	no bid	
no bid	no bid	no bid	
no bid	no bid	no bid	
no bid	no bid	no bid	
no bid	no bid	no bid	
no bid	no bid	no bid	
	\$108,275.00	no bid	
		no bid	

